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Did you know….

96% of the children in Bartlett Center’s childcare program are from low-income 
families with working parents who receive some state assistance.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Big Brothers Big Sisters in St. Joseph started as a United Way Leadership St. Joseph 
group project in 2007.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Catholic Charities serves anyone, not just those that are Catholic, and last year they 
provided permanent supportive housing to 44 households with 99 individuals who 
had been homeless.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Last year, The CENTER added an Autism Spectrum Disorder Clinician so they can 
provide testing and diagnosis services.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Children’s Mercy has operated a clinic on the campus of Mosaic where area families 
can receive care for some conditions without having to drive to Kansas City for more 
than eight  years.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Community Missions provided the Cold Weather Shelter for men and women this 
past winter. 

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Family Guidance Center recently opened the Behavioral Health Urgent Care Clinic. 
The clinic is open 7am-7pm five days a week. Anyone in the community who is 
experiencing mental health symptoms or substance misuse can walk in and see a 
provider.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

United Way Reading Adventure connected volunteers with more than 200 students 
during the summer months.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

InterServ offers programs and services from infants to the elderly and everyone in 
between. In their early care and education program, approximately 75% of the 
children they serve are from families with low incomes and 60% of those are foster 
children.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

In 2022, the local Legal Aid office closed 318 family law cases, including 30 
divorces, 23 custody cases, 46 guardianships, and helped clients obtain 70 orders of 
protection.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

More than 1500 students from 5 different school districts learned about local 
employers and education required to work in particular jobs from area businesses 
through United Way’s Speakers Bureau. 

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Through the Help Me Hotline, last year NWMO Community Services had more than 
32,000 contacts with people who were in need of assistance and made more than 
8600 referrals to community resources. 

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

The Noyes Home for Children partnered with the Pony Express Council, Boy Scouts 
of America to form Cub Scout Pack 801 to serve the youth in their care.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

United Way Success By 6® connected child care providers to resources resulting in 
providers being awarded more than $2.25 million to sustain 2,168 licensed child care 
slots and help create 246 new slots.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

St. Joseph Safety and Health Council offers several programs for teen drivers 
including a permit academy and a drivers education program that includes classroom 
education and driving lessons. 

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

The Salvation Army’s Pathways of Hope program provided on-going support to 23 
families last year who moved out of the Booth Center Family Shelter. 

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Specialty Industries employed 129 individuals with disabilities last year. For one of 
their contracts, they packed 1.5 million cases of cat food. 

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

UCP’s integrated preschool for children has small class sizes and student/teacher 
ratios to allow for individualized instruction. Children with and without special needs 
play, learn and discover their world together.

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Last year 103 children participated in the YMCA summer camp for school age 
childcare.  

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool



Did you know….

Last year the YWCA’s GRIT Center served 109 teens and provided 146 workshops to 
help teens with a variety of issues and topics. 

#TheWAYBeginsWithYou
#CaringIsCool


